
What is the capital city of the country 
of Georgia? 

 
 

Tbilisi 

According to the Christian New 
Testament, what king ruled Judea at 

 
 

King Herod the Great 

What Baltic country is located 
between Estonia and Lithuania? 

 
 

Latvia 

What is the capital city of Ecuador?
 
 

Quito 

What is the capital city of Liberia? 
 
 

Monrovia 

What Greek writer is commonly 

 
 

Herodotus 

What mitten-shaped state is located 
just north of Ohio? 

 
 

Michigan 

What is the capital city of 
Kyrgyzstan? 

 
 

Bishkek 

What is the capital city of Denmark? 
 
 

Copenhagen 

What is the earliest known writing, 
developed in ancient Sumer at the 
end of the fourth millennium BCE? 

 
cuneiform 
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Ancient Babylon was located in what 
modern country? 

 
 

Iraq 

What is the capital city of Croatia?
 
 

Zagreb 

What is the capital city of Djibouti? 
 
 

Djibouti 

What are the natives of Australia 
known as? 

 
 

Aborigines 

Ancient Troy is believed to have been 
located in what modern country? 

 
 

Turkey 

What is the capital city of Scotland?
 
 

Edinburgh 

What is the capital city of Yemen? 
 
 

Sanaa 

population lives in what country?
 
 

China  

Fletcher Christian led a mutiny 
against what captain near Tahiti, in 

1789? 
 
 

Captain William Bligh 

What is the capital city of Somalia?
 
 

Mogadishu 

Student Handouts (Order #3781448)



What is the capital city of Sweden?
 
 

Stockholm 

Death by boiling was introduced by 
what king of England? 

 
 

Henry VIII 

What product was banned from 
advertising on American television in 

1971? 
 

cigarettes 

What is the administrative capital of 
South Africa? 

 
 

Pretoria 

What is the capital city of Sudan? 
 
 

Khartoum 

What is the capital of Russia?
 
 

Moscow 

Who served as the first president of 
the Russian Federation? 

 
 

Boris Yeltsin 

What is the capital city of Lithuania?
 
 

Vilnius 

What is the capital city of China? 
 
 

Beijing 

What king of England legalized the 
killing of gypsies? 

 
 

Henry VIII 
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Who was issued a patent for the first 
flushing toilet, in the 18th century? 

 
 

Alexander Cummings 

What is the capital city of Uganda?
 
 

Kampala 

What is the capital city of Uruguay? 
 
 

Montevideo 

In what year did the Soviet Union 
collapse? 

 
 

1991 

What is the capital of Ukraine? 
 
 

Kiev 

What is the capital city of Senegal?
 
 

Dakar 

What is the capital city of Slovakia? 
 
 

Bratislava 

What landscaping tool was invented 
by Edwin Budding in the 1820s?

 
 

lawnmower 

What timesaving device stole the 
show when it premiered at the 1893 

 
 
 

dishwasher 

What is the capital city of Jordan?
 
 

Amman 
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What is the capital city of Israel?
 
 

Jerusalem 

What place is known for the highest 
temperatures recorded in the United 

States? 
 
 

Death Valley 

The 15 judges of the World Court are 
elected by what organization? 

 
 

United Nations 

What is the capital city of 
Kazakhstan? 

 
 

Astana 

What is the capital city of Italy? 
 
 

Rome 

What large Spanish-speaking country 
borders the southwestern United 

States? 
 
 

Mexico 

What island country is technically 
called the Republic of China? 

 
 

Taiwan 

What is the capital city of Kenya?
 
 

Nairobi 

What is the capital city of Jamaica? 
 
 

Kingston 

What three European countries 
border Greece to the north? 

 
 

Albania, Macedonia, and Bulgaria
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